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BIDDERS
Lindenmeyer 

Munroe
Agni 

Enterprises EVF Procurement WB Mason

DESCRIPTION Price / Pkg / Item 
#

Price / Pkg / 
Item # Price / Pkg / Item # Price / Pkg / Item 

#

#10 Regular Tinted Envelopes - 24# Wove, White
82.90   2500  

E10050
70.22    500     
QUA69122

16.59     250     
7QCFENV922R    

68.50     2500     
LINDE10050

#10 Window Tinted Envelopes - 24# Wove, White
94.00   2500   

E11050
43.76    500    
UNV35203

28.59     250     
7QCFENV3768QFC    

79.00    2500  
LINDE11050

#10 Regular Envelopes - 24# Wove, White - CVC03982
58.70    2500  

E10001
29.57    500    
OFF82292

40.56       500         
3-32264-BOX      

56.50   2500/ct   
CVC03982

#10 Window Envelopes - 24# Wove - White - CVC04048
77.60    2500  

E11001
36.99    500    
UNV35211

41.16      500           
3-04048-BOX      

62.60   2500/ct     
CVC04048

#10 Regular Strathmore Envelopes - 24# Wove, Ivory
220.00  2500  

M45831
109.04    500    
Strathmore

52.29     500     
STTM45831        

193.50   2500   
STTM45831

#9 Regular Envelopes - 24# Wove, White
65.80    2500  

E09001
48.66    500    
QUA90090

36.96       500          
3-03975-BOX      

6 3/4 Window Envelopes - 24# Wove - White
162.60    5000   

04029
64.81    1000    

Office Express
16.59     250     

7QCFENV1261R     
9 1/2 x 12 1/2 Peel & Seal Manilla Envelopes - 28# Brown 
Kraft

78.00    500     
04144

77.57    250    
UNV35291

143.80     500         
3-04134                 

9 1/2 x 12 1/2 Manilla Envelopes - 28# Brown Kraft
59.00     500     

04142
24.73    100    
UNV35265

20.93     100            
OFF82302          

10 x 13 Catalog Envelopes - 28# Brown Kraft
60.00     500    

04153
31.74    100    
UNV35267 27.87      50

10 x 15 Catalog Envelopes - 28# Brown Kraft
83.70      500   

04161
45.47    100    
UNV35268

46.59     50                  
11173-50

#12 Regular Envelopes - 28# Brown Kraft
250.00   2500   

03996
110.58    500    
QUA11462

18.99        50       
12R-03996-50      

#11 Regular Envelope - 24# Brown Kraft 
144.00   2500   

03987N
65.12    500    
QUA11362

18.94       50                 
66464

#11 Regular Envelope - 24# White
131.00   2500   

43667N
33.12    500    
UNV36320 26.19     100                    

6 3/4 Regular Envelopes - 24# Wove, White
125.50   5000   

E06005
36.34    500    
UNV35206

22.59     250     
7QCFENV33002C    

6 3/4 Remittance Envelopes - 24# Wove, White
125.00  3000   

E06001 NO BID 40.56      500       3-
LEWW450-Box  

#10 Window Simple Seal Envelopes
137.00   2500   

E21318
44.76    500    
UNV36321

82.56      500            
3-28727-BOX

#10 Regular Simple Seal Envelopes
115.00   2500   

E11118
33.12    500    
UNV36320 25.00       500

#9 Window Envelopes - 24# Wove, White
83.00   2500   

E09101
55.55    500    
UNV35219

15.39      250     
7QCFENV1491R

#10 Window Envelopes - 24# Wove, White WINDOW ON 
THE RIGHT

83.00     2500     
34050

83.10    500    
QUA21332 41.79     500

6 x 9 Booklet Envelope - White
21.00    500   

E02041
112.95    500    
QUA37181

47.61     250          
19306

5 1/2 Bar - 70# Vellum, White
50.00  1000   

M53042 NO BID 59.76     250            
3-7406500-F-BOX

5 1/2 Bar Finch Opaque Text - 70# Vellum, Vanilla
53.00   1000     

M56042 NO BID 1516-7060              
10     6.42

8 1/2 x 14 20# Hammermill Fore MP - Color
90.00     5000     

varies
16.39    500   

PAPER103317
22.59        500            

103390
89.40     5000     
SPHL02403X
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11 x 17 65# Mohawk Brite Hue Bristol Cover - Color
98.50    1000     
varies Astro NO BID 50.76          250              

3-103937-P   

11 x 17 65# Accent Opaque Digital Smooth Cover - White 
(#121954)

81.00   1250     
12195-4

28.44    250    
NEENAH   

PAPERWAU80
213

24.03      250               
121954

75.60   1250/ct   
HMM121954

11 x 17 65# Accent Opaque Digital (#188570)
74.00   1250     

18857-0 NO BID 42.99       250                
188081l

69.00  1250/cs   
HMM188570PK

11 x 17 67# Springhill Vellum Bristol Cover - Color
56.00    1000    

varies
45.58    250    

B00B7MDKTI
64.59       250            

026004
49.92   1000/ct   
SPHLOX6004

8 1/2 x 11 65# Mohawk Brite Hue Vellum Cover - Color

99.00    2000    
varies Astro 

Brights

18.47    250    
INTERNATION
ALSGH026000

28.56         500                
3-101 592-P         

8 1/2 x 11 65# Springhill Opaque Offset Cover - Color

80.00    2500     
varies

13.87    250    
INTERNATION
ALSGH026000

48.99          250               
14054

79.60   2500   
SPHL01405X

8 1/2 x 11 67# Springhill Vellum Bristol Cover - Color

53.00     2000     
varies

12.34    250    
INTERNATION
ALSGH036000

10.19     250              
SGH057000

40.72   2000/ct   
SPHLOX6000

8 1/2 x 11 90# Springhill Index Digital Cover - Color

74.50     2500     
varies

29.03    250    
INTERNATION
ALSGH045100

12.84     250            
45100

56.20    2500/ct    
SPHLOX5100

8 1/2 x 11 65# Accent Opaque Digital Cover - White

74.50   2500     
18856-0

17.57    250    
NEENAH  

PAPERWAU91
904

14.24      250             
188560

67.00   2500   
HMM188560

11 x 17 60# Springhill Opaque Offset Digital Colors
77.50     2500     

varies NO BID 45.99     500                
24033

11 x 17 80# Finch Opaque Smooth - Bright White (#1008-
8018)

66.50    1500     
1008-8018

37.01    250    
INTERNATION
ALGH015110

40.56     250             
3-2508-8024-I-P

8 1/2 x 11 20# Hammermill Fore MP Colors

64.00     5000     
varies

12.88    500    
HPHAM168030

15.03     500                 
102210

42.20   5000/ct   
WBM22201XX

8 1/2 x 11 20# Mohawk Brite Hue Color
104.00     5000     

varies Astro NO BID 25.56     500                 
3-103894-P    

8 1/2 x 11 24# Strathmore Writing Wove - Ivory

243.00     5000    
300-029

44.76    500    
MOHAWK    

FINESTT30002
9

51.39     500                 
300-029

221.00   5000   
STT300029

8 1/2 x 11 24# Strathmore Writing Wove - White

242.00     5000    
300-220

33.83    500    
MOHAWK    

FINESTT30003
3

33.36     500             
3-300018-P

221.00   5000   
STT300220

2 part 8 1/2 x 11 Carbonless Black Print Reverse 167.00    2500 
sets   3R12850

164.92    5000    
XER3R12850

169.00     2500        
    ‎5887NCASE

142.70 2500 
sets     

NCR5887N
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3 part 8 1/2 x 11 Carbonless Black Print Reverse

177.00    1670 
sets   3R12854

179.18    5010    
  XER3R12854

48.50     500               
   5900

159.30   1670 
sets   

NCR5900N

4 part 8 1/2 x 11 Carbonless Black Print Reverse

194.00   1250 
sets   3R12856

187.48    5000    
  XER3R12856

49.22     500                 
     5925

168.60 1250 
sets   

NCR5915N

2 part 8 1/2 x 14 Carbonless Black Print Reverse
250.00   2500 
sets   3R12852 NO BID 41.80     250

3 part 8 1/2 x 14 Carbonless Black Print Reverse
560.00    1670 
sets   5902N NO BID 34.93     500              

  PSDEC-3-85-14
8 1/2 x 11 80# Finch Opaque Digital Cover - White (#2508-
8004)

79.00     2000    
 2508-8004 NO BID 38.79     250         

2508-8004
8 1/2 x 11 80# Finch Opaque Text - Bright White (#1008-
8004)

64.00     3000    
 1008-8004 NO BID 24.97     500                

    3-1008-8004-I-P
8 1/2 x 11 80# Hammermill Color Copy Digital Cover - 
White (#120023)

91.00    2000    
12002-3

15.11    250    
HAM120023

33.99      250              
   120023     

84.00    2000/ct   
 HAM120023

8 1/2 x 11 70# International Offset Smooth - White

62.00    4000   
05335

28.65    250   
INTERNATION
ALSGH015101

13.90     500              
  188176I

55.84   4000   
HMM05335

8 1/2 x 11 65# Mohawk Skytone Vellum Cover - Color 188.00   2500   
varies

28.32    250    
INTERNATION
ALSGH097000

29.16      250        3-
71200300-F-P

8 1/2 x 11 60#  Accent Opaque Digital Text Smooth - 
White (# 109355)

62.25   5000    
10935-5

17.37    250    
NEENAH  

PAPERWAU22
401

19.32      500                 
      10935-5

58.30   5000/ct   
HMM109355

8 1/2 x 11 20# Copy Paper - White
38.70   5000/ct   

 MON11
54.41  5000    

UNV21200
40.59      5000             
    433COPYPAPER 

33.83   5000/ct   
WBM21200

8 1/2 x 11 20# Recycled Copy Paper - White
53.00      5000   

 5101
58.52    5000    

UNV20030
HAM67780               

 2500     35.93
35.53    5000/ct    

  WBM20030
8 1/2 x 11 100# Everyday Digital Coated Gloss - White (# 
65822)

77.00   1500    
65822 NO BID 127.98      250              

     65822

11 x 17 60#  Accent Opaque Digital Text Smooth - White 
(# 109397)

66.00   2500     
10939-7

36.03    250    
NEENAH  

PAPERWAU40
414

21.39     500                    
        LIND109397                   

61.10   2500/ct   
HMM109397

8 1/2 x 14 60#  Accent Opaque Digital Text Smooth - 
White (# 188033)

85.00   5000     
18803-3 NO BID 22.59            500                

           18803-3
78.70    5000/ct    

  HMM188033
8 1/2 x 11 60# Offset Crack n Peel White Adhesive Paper 
Permanent

220.00   1000    
 LL2135

37.51    750    
UNV80011

325.90        1000              
         SC-9598

8 1/2 x 11 Carbonless CB-20 - White - Black Image
196.00  5000  

3R12858
45.33    500    
XER3R12435

48.36          500               
        3-5887-P

8 1/2 x 11 Carbonless CF-20 - Pink - Black Image
148.00  5000  

3R12865
42.86    500    
B009R56D14

54.96       501                
      3-5795-P  

Fan Apart Adhesive - 1 qt
43.00        1        

  3R12590
35.04    1          

HAR 35.68        1                              

Padding Compound - 1 qt
15.00        1        

  26393
33.77    1       

HAR
16.60     1 jar/16 ea                
               S-20857

11.37       1     
LIND26393

MINIMUM ORDER TO AVOID SHIPPING FEES 500.00 1 case
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SUBJECT TO FINAL APPROVAL
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